
SITE SYNOPSIS 
 
 
SITE NAME:  ROGERSTOWN ESTUARY SPA 
 
SITE CODE:  004015 
 
 
Rogerstown Estuary is situated about 2 km north of Donabate in north County Dublin.  
It is a relatively small, funnel shaped estuary separated from the sea by a sand and 
shingle peninsula; the site extends eastwards to include an area of shallow marine 
water.  The estuary receives the waters of the Ballyboghil and Ballough rivers and has 
a wide salinity range, from near full seawater to near full freshwater.  The estuary is 
divided by a causeway and narrow bridge, built in the 1840s to carry the Dublin-
Belfast railway line. At low tide extensive intertidal sand and mud flats are exposed 
and these provide the main food resource for the wintering waterfowl that use the site.  
The intertidal flats of the estuary are mainly of sands, with soft muds in the north-
west sector and along the southern shore.  Associated with these muds are stands of 
Common Cord-grass (Spartina anglica).  Green algae (mainly Ulva spp.) are 
widespread and form dense mats in the more sheltered areas.  The intertidal vascular 
plant Beaked Tasselweed (Ruppia maritima) grows profusely in places beneath the 
algal mats and is grazed by herbivorous waterfowl (notably Light-bellied Brent Goose 
and Wigeon).  Salt marsh fringes parts of the estuary, especially its southern shores.  
Common plant species of the saltmarsh include Sea Rush (Juncus maritimus), Sea 
Purslane (Halimione portulacoides) and Common Saltmarsh-grass (Puccinellia 
maritima). 
 
The site is a Special Protection Area (SPA) under the E.U. Birds Directive, of special 
conservation interest for the following species: Greylag Goose, Light-bellied Brent 
Goose, Shelduck, Shoveler, Oystercatcher, Ringed Plover, Grey Plover, Knot, Dunlin, 
Black-tailed Godwit and Redshank.  The E.U. Birds Directive pays particular 
attention to wetlands and, as these form part of this SPA, the site and its associated 
waterbirds are of special conservation interest for Wetland & Waterbirds. 
 
Rogerstown Estuary is an important winter waterfowl site and supports a population 
of Light-bellied Brent Goose of international importance (1,069) - all counts are mean 
peaks over the five winters 1995/96 – 1999/2000.  A further 10 species have 
populations of national importance as follows: Greylag Goose (160), Shelduck (773), 
Shoveler (59), Oystercatcher (1,345), Ringed Plover (188), Grey Plover (229), Knot 
(2,454), Dunlin (2,745), Black-tailed Godwit (195) and Redshank (490).  The Greylag 
Geese are part of a larger population which spends most of the winter on Lambay 
Island.  Other species which occur regularly include Wigeon (358), Teal (346), 
Mallard (214), Red-breasted Merganser (30), Golden Plover (1,059) Lapwing (2,129), 
Sanderling (50), Curlew (505) and Turnstone (77). Large numbers of gulls including 
Herring Gull, Great Black-backed Gull and Black-headed Gull are attracted to the 
area, partly due to the presence of an adjacent local authority landfill site.  Little 
Egret, a species which has recently colonised Ireland, also occurs at this site. 
 



Some of the wader species also occur on passage, notably Black-tailed Godwit with 
numbers often exceeding 300 in April.  The estuary is a regular staging post for scarce 
migrants, especially in autumn when Green Sandpiper, Ruff, Little Stint, Curlew 
Sandpiper and Spotted Redshank may be seen.  Shelduck breed within the site.   
 
Rogerstown Estuary SPA is an important link in the chain of estuaries on the east 
coast.  It supports an internationally important population of Light-bellied Brent 
Goose and nationally important populations of a further 10 species.  The presence of 
Little Egret and Golden Plover is of note as these species are listed on Annex I of the 
E.U. Birds Directive.  Rogerstown Estuary is also a Ramsar Convention site, and part 
of Rogerstown Estuary SPA is designated as a Statutory Nature Reserve and a 
Wildfowl Sanctuary. 
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